MSBG Bread Bid 2020

Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.

Zone 4

Brand Dlsg::tor D:.scc':-l:ﬂ{z:n Al;ca:EEI D; r’::::: Pr:::c:er Vendor Comment

1 |Bagel, approx. 3 oz. Sliced 2.00 300z. | 63350z | 6 450 Thomas 7081 6pk 200z 6 X 3.00 450 1,350.00| Does “‘:L?”‘ we
2 S::::");:"% WW. sliced, approx. 4x4, | s o0r0x 17 0z. and 16 slices 1.00 100z | 17 oz loaf 16,154 Rl gar7 | 2402 52"20::3"'8 X 1.35 16,154 21,807.90
3 gr':if‘dt'ol‘;z? WW, sliced, approx. 4x5, | o050y 20 0z. and 15 slices 1.00 1330z | 200z loaf 695 695 NO BID
4 |Bread, club,wheat, sliced, approx. 4x4 Approx. 28 oz. and 26 slices 1.00 1.0,0z. 28 oz. loaf 4,739 R&l 5389 280z 24 usable X 1.45 4,739 . 6,871.55
5 |Bread, french, wheat, unsliced Approx.14 oz. and 22 inches N/A N/A 14 oz. loaf 260 - 260 NO BID
6 [Bread, multigrain, or 5 grain, sliced Approx. 20 oz. and 15 slices 1.00 1.33 oz. 20 oz. loaf 45 R&l 6326 240z 14 usable X 1.80 45 81.00 12 Grain
g |CC R, RRoK. T Wheskar white | A oprox. 3.0 oz. 2,00 300z | 4300z | 4 300 : 300 NO BID
8 [English muffins, wheat or white wheat Approx. 2.0 oz. and 3.5 inch, sliced 2.00 200z 122.0 0z. 12 888 Thomas 7057 6pk 120z 6 X 1.59 1,776 2,823.84 Wheat
9  [Panini, wheat, sliced. oat topped Approx. 38 oz. and 20 slices 1.00 200z 38 oz. loaf - I NO BID
10 |Roll bulkie, seedless, wheat orwhite | approx 2.5 0z and 4", sliced 2,00 250z | 122500z | 6 7,492 RaI 3242 12pk 2402 12 X 171 3,746 6,405.66 Wheat
11 |Roll, dinner, wheat or white wheat e o 100z | 30100z | 30 | 17771 Rl 5397 12pk 140z 12 X 1.41 44,428 62,642.78 Wheat
12 |Roll, dinner, honey wheat 1 oz., individuals 1,00 1.0 0z. 12 1.0z. 12 - NO BID
13 |Roll, French, 4", wheat or white wheat Sliced, but attached at one side 1.00 1.5 oz. 12 1.5 0z. 12 - NO BID
14 |Roll, hamburger, wheat or white wheat 3.5inch, 2 oz, sliced 2.00 200z 122.0 oz 12 28,802 R&! 5392 16pk 350z 16 X 1.96 21,602 42,338.94 Wheat
15 [Roll, hot dog, wheat or white wheat New England Style, top sliced 2.00 2.0 0z 122.0 oz. 16 13,709 R&l 5393 16pk 350z 16 X 1.96 13,709 26,869.64 Wheat
16 [Roll, sub 6", wheat or white wheat Sliced, but attached at one side 2.00 2.00z. 12200z 6 5,650 R&l 6375 6pk 120z 6 X 1.56 5,650 8,814.00 Wheat
17 [Roll, sub, 8", wheat or white wheat Sliced, but attached at one side 2.00 3.0 0z. 63.00z 6 2,484 - 2,484 NO BID
18 |Wrap, 10" diameter, wheat Round 2.00 3.0 0z. 123.0 oz. 12 1,540 - 1,540 NO BID
19 |Wrap, 8" diameter, wheat Round 2.00 2.00z. 102.0 oz. 10 2,795 Sahara 3389 8pk 120z 8 X 272 3,494 9,503.00

Grand Total: 189,508.31



